Approved

L=
gﬂwm%m%w Manager

[21/pez
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Requests ate ﬂ]led in accordance with the provisions of Chaptets 119 and 257, Flotida Statutes.

DATE: / 17 / D
NAME: Seott [Nilles
coMPANY:

ADDRESS:" .

PHONE: : FAX:

FIATE: slmqk}oo D ool.com

REQUEST (Attach addlﬂonal page, if necessary) Copies of the following documents:
\

(Conressinn Contt > 2w

Hm oS omoL Du ot

DdeJ %m mds T — ‘\H‘\ﬁ
\/.u(m; @wmm Cheorrent
)

S oo o R R R K ook KK R Rk K ko R K K o o

FOR USE BY VILLAGE STAFF ONLY ' 'IRACKINGNO tzél D Zz /

paTE rorwarpeD: | T TIAO ASSIGNED DEPT: f’” 1NONCK
DATE REQUEST FILLED: NUMBER OF COPIES:

ESTIMATED TIME (F APPLICABLE): ____ BSTIMATED COST:

HOW WAS REQUEST FILLED? |

IF NOT FILLED, REASON:

BY: . ) : :




Melissa Dodgi

From: Fanny Carmona

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 9:05 AM
To: Scott Miller

Cc: Missy Arocha; Melissa Dodge
Subject: RE: Concession contract

Mr. Miller please note that is considered a public records request. | am forwarding your request to the Village Clerk's
office.

Thank you,
Fanny

----- Original Message-----

From: Scott Miller <sim9400@icloud.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2020 6:18 PM

To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Subject: Re: Concession contract

CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.

Good evening
| will meet next Tuesday for a look see

<s it possible to get the amounts paid by the contract holder to the city during the current contract Thanks Scott7

Sent from my iPhone

> 0nJan 16, 2020, at 3:16 PM, Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov> wrote:

Z Good afternoon Scott,

>

> Please advise what day and time you like to go by and | can ask the Park Supervisor to show you around.
>

> Thanks,

> Fanny

> -----Qriginal Message-----

> From: Scott Miller <sim9400@icloud.com>

> Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2020 1:05 PM

> To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>

> Subject: Concession contract

>

> CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.
>

>

> Can you help schedule a site inspection for the concession contract
> location Thanks Scott

>
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Yanara Modrono

From: Desmond Chin

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 3:50 PM

To: Yanara Modrofio

Cc: N Olga Cadaval; Missy Arocha; Melissa Dodge; Idalmy Vidaurre; Karla Morales-Maestre;
antss N A Greg Truitt

Subject: RE: Public Record Request - 2020-025 (Miller)
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Desmond Chin

Finance Director
Village of Palmetto Bay
305-259-1268 Phone
305-259-1290 Fax

Under Florida Law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.

————— Original Message-----

From: Yanara Modrofio <ymodrono@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 3:33 PM

To: Desmond Chin <dchin@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Cc: Olga Cadaval <ocadaval@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Melissa Dodge
<mdodge @palmettobay-fl.gov>; Idalmy Vidaurre <ividaurre @palmettobay-fl.gov>; Karla Morales-Maestre
<kmorales@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Greg Truitt <gtruitt@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Subject: FW: Public Record Request - 2020-025 (Miller)

Good afternoon Desmond,
Please see the attached request and forward the response to my attention and cc’ Karla.
Thank you!

Yanara Modroio

Executive Assistant

Office of the Village Manager
Village of Palmetto Bay

9705 East Hibiscus Street
Palmetto Bay, Florida 33157
T:305-259-1234

F: 305-259-1290

From: Melissa Dodge <mdodge @palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 3:01 PM

To: Yanara Modrofio <ymodrono@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Olga Cadaval <ocadaval@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Cc: Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Greg Truitt <gtruitt@palmettobay-fl.gov>
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Subject: Public Record Request - 2020-025 (Miller)
Good Afternoon,

Attached is Public Record Request No. 2020-025 received from Mr. Scott Miller. Please forward to the appropriate
department.

Sincerely,

Melissa Dodge

Administrative Assistant/Passport Acceptance Agent Office of the Village Clerk Village of Palmetto Bay
9705 East Hibiscus Street

Palmetto Bay, FL 33157

Ph: 305-259-1234

Fax: 305-259-1290

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has very broad public records laws. Most written communications to or from local officials
regarding official business are public records available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail
communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 9:05 AM

To: Scott Miller <slm9400@icloud.com>

Cc: Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Melissa Dodge <mdodge @palmettobay-fl.gov>
Subject: RE: Concession contract

Mr. Miller please note that is considered a public records request. | am forwarding your request to the Village Clerk's
office.

Thank you,
Fanny

From: Scott Miller <slm9400@icloud.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2020 6:18 PM

To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Subject: Re: Concession contract

CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.
Good evening

| will meet next Tuesday for a look see

Is it possible to get the amounts paid by the contract holder to the city during the current contract Thanks Scott

Sent from my iPhone

> 0n Jan 16, 2020, at 3:16 PM, Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov> wrote:
>




> Good afternoon Scott,

>

> Please advise what day and time you like to go by and | can ask the Park Supervisor to show you around.
>

> Thanks,

> Fanny

> From: Scott Miller <siIm9400@icloud.com>

> Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2020 1:05 PM

> To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>

> Subject: Concession contract

>

> CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.
>

>

> Can you help schedule a site inspection for the concession contract
> location Thanks Scott

>

> Sent from my iPhone




