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9705 E. HIBISCUS STREET
. PALMETTO BAY, ELORIDA 33157
(305) 259-1234  Fax: (305)259-1290
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Requests ate ﬂ]led in accordance with the provisions of Chapters 119 and 257, Florida Statutes.
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From: Fanny Carmona

Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 10:26 AM

To: Missy Arocha

Cc: Yanara Modrofio; Melissa Dodge; Melissa Salado
Subject: FW: Farmers market

----- Original Message-----

From: SCOTT MILLER <sim9400@aol.com>

Sent: Saturday, January 18, 2020 11:07 AM

To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Subject: Farmers market

CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.
Good morning please consider this as a public records request | am interested to see the documents of the amount of

rent due from the current provider not interested if they already back money just take what they are supposed to pay
thank you Scott Miller Sent from my iPhone



Yanara Modrono
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From: Fanny Carmona

Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2020 5:06 PM

To: Yanara Modrofio

Cc: Karla Morales-Maestre

Subject: RE: Public Record Request - 2020-028 (Miller)
Attachments: 20200122165803015.pdf

As requested, please see attached under agreement Article 4 Payment and/or Fees The monthly payment will be ($800)
eight hundred dollars per month.

From: Yanara Modrofio <ymodrono@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2020 3:33 PM

To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Cc: Olga Cadaval <ocadaval@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Melissa Dodge
<mdodge @palmettobay-fl.gov>; Idaimy Vidaurre <ividaurre@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Karla Morales-Maestre
<kmorales@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Greg Truitt <gtruitt@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Subject: FW: Public Record Request - 2020-028 (Miller)

Good afternoon Fanny,
Please see the attached request and forward the response to my attention and cc’ Karla.
Thank you!

Yanara Modrofio

Executive Assistant

Office of the Village Manager
Village of Palmetto Bay

9705 East Hibiscus Street
Palmetto Bay, Florida 33157
T:305-259-1234
F:305-259-1290

From: Melissa Dodge <mdodge @palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, January 22, 2020 12:17 PM

To: Yanara Modrofio <ymodrono@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Olga Cadaval <ocadaval@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Cc: Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Greg Truitt <gtruitt@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Subject: Public Record Request - 2020-028 (Miller)

Good Afternoon,

Attached is Public Record Request No. 2020-028 received from Mr. Scott Miller. Please forward to the appropriate
department.

Sincerely,




Melissa Dodge

Administrative Assistant/Passport Acceptance Agent Office of the Village Clerk Village of Palmetto Bay
9705 East Hibiscus Street

Palmetto Bay, FL 33157

Ph: 305-259-1234

Fax: 305-259-1290

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has very broad public records laws. Most written communications to or from local officials
regarding official business are public records available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail
communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.

From: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2020 10:26 AM

To: Missy Arocha <marocha@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Cc: Yanara Modrofio <ymodrono@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Melissa Dodge <mdodge@palmettobay-fl.gov>; Melissa Salado
<msalado@palmettobay-fl.gov>

Subject: FW: Farmers market

From: SCOTT MILLER <slm3400@aol.com>

Sent: Saturday, January 18, 2020 11:07 AM

To: Fanny Carmona <fcarmona@palmettobay-fl.gov>
Subject: Farmers market

CAUTION: EXTERNAL SENDER -- Please avoid opening any unexpected attachments or clicking any strange links.
Good morning please consider this as a public records request | am interested to see the documents of the amount of

rent due from the current provider not interested if they already back money just take what they are supposed to pay
thank you Scott Miller Sent from my iPhone
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12. As stipulated in the prepared bid document of the Village, no alcoholic
beverages will be allowed, selling or consuming,

13. Food vendors will need to be approved by the Health Departmer
There will be no usage of Styrofoam cups; plates take home boxes as
mandated by the Village of Palmetto Bay ordinance.
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Article 3 Qualifications

Company and the individual executing this Agreement on behalf of the Company
warrant to the Village that the Company is a Corporation duly constituted and
authorized to do business in the State of Florida, is in good standing and that
Company possesses all of the required licenses and certificates of competen

required by the State of Florida, Miami Dade County, and the Village to perform
the services herein described. Company acknowledges that due to the nature of
this contract, that Company must take all necessary precautions to avoid accidents
and shall comply with all local, state and federal regulations that apply. Company
shall be solely responsible for the payment of any fines or penalties incurred as|a
result of its actions.

Article 4 Payment and/or Fees

The total monthly payment will be ($800.00) eight hundred dollars per month. As
agreed by the Village and Company, on “rained out” days that the vendors were
not able to set up, the Village will accept the credit for that day. If the vendors are
set up and the Farmers Market closes early due to weather, the Village will credit
50% of that given day. In the summer months from June to August there will be|a
reduced monthly payment of ($600.00) six hundred dollars per month with the

same “rained out” day schedule and payment plan.
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