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RESOLUTION NO. 2012-16

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND VILLAGE COUNCIL OF THE
VILLAGE OF PALMETTO BAY, FLORIDA, RELATING TO PARKS AND
RECREATION; AUTHORIZING THE VILLAGE MANAGER TO
ENTER INTO CONTRACT WITH KORKAT PLAYGROUNDS & SITE
AMENITIES FOR THE PURCHASE, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION
OF A TODDLER PLAYGROUND AREA (AGES 0-2) AT CORAL REEF
PARK; PIGGYBACKING WITH THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF PALM
BEACH COUNTY, FLORIDA’S CONTRACT NO. 10C-54; AND
AUTHORIZING THE VILLAGE MANAGER TO APPROVE
EXPENDITURE OF FUNDS IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED
$31,252.82; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, a professional safety audit inspection was conducted for the Playgrounds at
Coral Reef Park and Palmetto Bay Park; and,

WHEREAS, the results of the audit inspection calls for several improvements,
replacements and repairs of the playground at Coral Reef Park; and,

WHEREAS, capital dollats have been identified and approved in the FY 2011-12 budget
for the playground improvements; and,

WHEREAS, this new equipment and surface material will provide a safe and healthy play
environment that meets both American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM) and Consumer
Product Safety Commission (CPSC) standards; and,

WHEREAS, in accordance with our procurement process, the Village wishes to piggyback
on the price agreement contract for park and playground equipment No. 10C-54B with the School
District of Palm Beach County; and,

WHEREAS, the Mayor and Council may authorize the Village Manager to enter into
agreement with KorKat Playground & Site Amenities for the purchase, delivery and installation of
the Toddler Playground Area (Ages 0-2) Equipment and Synthetic Turf at Coral Reef Park; and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND VILLAGE
COUNCIL OF THE VILLAGE OF PALMETTO BAY, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The Village Manager is hereby authorized to enter into agreement with
KorKat Playground & Site Amenities for the purchase, delivery and installation of Toddler
Playground Equipment (ages 0-2) and Synthetic Tutf at Coral Reef Park; consistent with the terms
and conditions proposed within quotation #14820.

Section 2. The Village Manager is hereby authorized to accept piggybacking prices with
the School District of Palm Beach County, Florida’s cooperative purchase contract No. 10C-54B.
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Section 3. The Village Manager 1s hereby authorized to issue a purchase order not to
exceed $31,252.82.
Section 4. This resolution shall take effect immediately upon adoption

PASSED and ADOPTED this 6th day of February, 2012.

Atest WﬂMXdﬁr@——

1gha Alexander
Wﬂgc Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

chedleatr

Eye A. Boutsis,
FJGUEREDO & BOUTSIS, P.A., as Office
ot the Village Attorney

FINAL VOTE AT ADOPTION:

Council Member Patrick Fiore YES
Council Member Howard J. Tendrich 7 YES
Council Member Joan Lindsay YES
Vice-Mayor Brian W. Pariser YES
Mayor Shelley Stanczyk. YES
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Estimate
PLASROUND HALES 3 WRILLATION
. Dat .
221 Cable Industrial Way ate Estimate #
Carrollton GA 30117 1/23/2012 14820
Name / Address Ship To
Coral Reef Park Coral Reef Park
7895 SW 152 Street 7895 SW 152 Street
Palmetto Bay, FL 33157 Palmetto Bay, FL 33157
Rep Project
AMR
Item Description Qty Cost Total
NOTE: ALL PRICING PER SCHOOL DISTRICT OF
PALM BEACH COUNTY, FL CONTRACT #10C-54B.
MEETS ASTM AND CPSC STANDARDS.
TFR00919 CRITTER HUT I 1,369.00 1,369.00T
CP-TREE CP-TREE, TODDLER TREE HOUSE 1,899.00 1,899.00T
MISC. 0-2 PLAYGROUND SAFETY SIGN 1 241.00 241.00T
SUBTOTAL 3,509.00
DISCOUNT 10% | DISCOUNT 10% PER SCHOOL DISTRICT OF PALM -10.00% -350.90
BEACH COUNTY, FL CONTRACT #10C-54B
PS3-29180 PS3-29180, PLAYLAND PLAYHOUSE 1 5,567.00 5,567.00T
DISCOUNT 20% DISCOUNT 20% VALID IF PURCHASED BY FEB. 06, -20.00% -1,113.40
2012
FREIGHT FREIGHT 1 1,200.00 1,200.00
INSTALL-EQUIP | INSTALLATION OF EQUIPMENT 1 2,131.28 2,131.28
REMOVAL REMOVAL OF FOUR CONCRETE CLIMBING 1 3,475.00 3,475.00
STRUCTURES & TURF EXCLUDING ANY SUB
MATERIAL
PERMITTING PERMITTING WITH DRAWINGS INCLUDED 1 1,200.00 1,200.00
STONE BASE ADD/REMOVE/REPAIR EXISTING COMPACTED 1,376 2.34 3,219.84T
STONE BASE
TURF INSTALL SYNTHETIC TURF 1,376 8.75 12,040.00T
***Please note that 50% deposit required at time of order if installation is included.
100% payment due at time of order if equipment only purchase. Municipalities exempt
from deposits with a valid purchase order.***
Prices quoted are good for 15 days and are subject to total purchase, except for shipping Total
which is subject to market changes. Installation prices assume normal soil conditions and
does not include rock excavation.
Phone # Fax # E-mail
770-214-9322 770-214-9323 kimberlyr@korkat.com Signature
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221 Cable Industrial Way

Carrollton GA

30117

Name / Address

Coral Reef Park
7895 SW 152 Street
Palmetto Bay, FL 33157

Estimate

Date

1/23/2012

Ship To

Coral Reef Park
7895 SW 152 Street
Palmetto Bay, FL 33157

Estimate #

14820

Rep

Project

ltem

Description

Qty Cost

Total

INSTALL-EQUIP

INSTALLATION OF AND SUPPLY ORANGE
TEMPORARY SAFETY FENCING 4' HIGH

NOTE: PRICE INCLUDES STONE, RUBBER,
BINDER AND INSTALLATION OF. PRICE
INCLUDES STONE, NAILER BOARD, TURF, TAPE,
GLUE AND INFILL. PRICE ASSUMES FREE AND
EASY ACCESS TO SITE (LIMITED ACCESS,
RESTRICTED HOURS, ETC ARE EXTRA). PRICE
DOES NOT INCLUDE SURVEYING, INSPECTIONS
OR LICENSES. PRICE DOES NOT INCLUDE
DEMOLITION, SITE PREP OR GRADING. PRICE
DOES NOT INCLUDE DRAINAGE SYSTEMS OR
CONCRETE WORK. PRICE DOES NOT INCLUDE
TEMPORARY FENCING OR SECURITY.

Total sales tax calculated by AvaTax ST
Select this as a transaction's tax to use AvaTax ST

375.00

0.00
0.00%

375.00

0.00
0.00

***Please note that 50% deposit required at time of order if installation is included.
100% payment due at time of order if equipment only purchase. Municipalities exempt
from deposits with a valid purchase order.***

Prices quoted are good for 15 days and are subject to total purchase, except for shipping

Total

which is subject to market changes. Installation prices assume normal soil conditions and
does not include rock excavation.

Phone #

770-214-9322

Fax # E-mail

770-214-9323
Page 2

kimberlyr@korkat.com

Signature

$31,252.82
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF SHARON SWAN ARTHUR C. JOHNSON, Ph.D.
PALM BEACH COUNTY, FLORIDA DIRECTOR SUPERINTENDENT OF SCHOOLS

Purchasing Department
3300 Forest Hill Boulevard, Suite A-323
West Palm Beach, FL 33406-5813

Phone: (561) 434-8216 Fax: (561)963-3823
www.palmbeachschools.org/purchasing

May 12, 2010

Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat, Inc.
Mr. Shane Lanier, Owner

221 Cable Industrial Way
Carrollton, GA 30117

shanel@korkat.com
Subject: Letter of Agreement
Bid Number: 10C-54B
Title: Term Contract for Playground Equipment, Surfacing, Shade Structures & Fitness Trails
Contract Term: May 3, 2010 through May 2, 2015
Dear Mr. Lanier:

This is to advise you that the School District of Palm Beach County, Florida, has accepted your offer to furnish
playground equipment, surfacing, shade structures and fitness trails. This acceptance is subject to compliance with bid
specifications, terms and conditions, all pertinent laws of the State of Florida and instructions as determined by the
General Counsel for the School District.

An original Certificate of Insurance as per special condition " Z ", "Insurance Requirements" must be mailed to School
District of Palm Beach County, 3300 Forest Hill Blvd. Ste A323, West Palm Beach, FL. 33406, Attention: Patricia Seeger
within fifteen (15) days of this notification. Your insurance company is required to have the School District of Palm
Beach County, Florida, NAMED AS AN ADDITIONAL INSURED. No work shall commence until we receive the
Certificate of Insurance and it must reference the above Bid Number. Please be sure to advise your insurance carrier.

Purchase orders will be issued to cover the playground equipment, surfacing, shade structures and fitness trails as the need
arises. Purchase orders are your notification to proceed with fulfilling the School Districts request. Shipment without
proper authorization may result in nonpayment.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call my office at 561-434-8310. Thank you for your bid and we are
looking forward to doing business with you and your company.

Sincerely,

S T

Sharon Swan, C.P.M., Director
Purchasing Department

CC: bidfile

Karen Adducci, Purchasing Agent %

PALM BEACH COUNTY SCHOOLS - RATED "A" BY THE FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION — 2005 - 2009
“HOME OF FLORIDA’S FIRST LEED GOLD CERTIFIED SCHOOL”

WWW.PALMBEACHSCHOOLS.ORG
The School District of Palm Beach County is an Equal Education Opportunity Provider and Employer




Date:

Joseph M. Moore, Chief Operating Officer
Award approved per School Board Policy 6.14

INVITATION TO BID NO.:10C-54B — TERM CONTRACT FOR PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT,

SURFACING, SHADE STRUCTURES & FITNESS TRAILS - REVISED
DATE: April 21, 2010 DATE OPENED: April 7, 2010
DATE SOLICITED: March 17, 2010 DATE POSTED: April 22, 2010

CONTRACT PERIOD: May 3, 2010 through May 2, 2015
REQUESTING DEPARTMENT: Various Schools & Departments

FINANCIAL IMPACT

The estimated annual financial impact to the District budget is $5,000,000. The source of funds is the
various schools and departments budgets.

Iltems to be purchased include playground equipment, outdoor fitness equipment, shade structures,
fitness ftrails, installation, site preparation, dig-out and excavation, sand, concrete for the pads and
sidewalks, surfacing for ADA accessibility and the installation of the surfacing. The equipment is bid at a
firm percentage discount off list price plus freight and installation. Surfacing, surfacing installation and all
site prep is bid at a firm rate per square foot. The bid establishes a pool of pre-qualified vendors to
furnish and install shade structures and fitness trails as requested. The project coordinator for the school
site manages each project. All equipment and surfacing are approved by Risk Management.

AWARD RECOMMENDATION / TABULATION

MINORITY

VENDOR STATUS ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4
(Ace Surfaces) --- --- --- -—-
American Recreational | --- 9% 5% Various N/A
Solutions, Inc.
Apollo Sunguard 8 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Systems
Bliss Products & - 12.5% 35% Various N/A
Services, Inc.
Christensen Systems --- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Columbia Cascade --- 12% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Company
D.W. Recreation - No Bid 25% No Bid No Bid
Services, Inc.
Gametime -—- 15% - 25% Various N/A

$15,00 & up

10%

$14,999 &

less
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba | --- 10% 28% Various N/A
Korkat, Inc. Playland




5% H20

Leadex Corporation - 4% 34% Various N/A

Playcraft

2%

Sportsplay

(/-

andstane)
Miracle Recreation - 20% 40% Various $2.00 per sq ft
Equipment Company
No Fault Sport Group, | --- No Bid No Bid Various N/A
LLC
Play It Safe 6 10% Union | 29% Various N/A

Land

8% Exccent

Play

8% Sports

Play
Playmore West, Inc. --- 10% 35% Various N/A

$10,000 &

up

2% less

than

$10,000
PlayPower LT - 10% No Bid Various N/A
Farmington, Inc.
RCP Shelters, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Regal Contractors, Inc. | --- No Bid 28% Various N/A
Rep Services, Inc. - 3% 36% Various N/A
Shade Systems, Inc. - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SkyShades of South 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Florida
Southeast Surfacing & | --- No Bid Various Various N/A
Recreation LLC
Spectra Contract - (10%) (5%) $10.99 per sq ft | N/A
Flooring — turf & $9.99

per sq ft — PIP

Sports Systems -- 5% 75% Various N/A
International, Inc.
Sun Shade, Inc. - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Superior Park -—- 5% Superior | 75% Various N/A
Systems, Inc. Park

Systems &

Recreation

Creations
Taylor Supply LLC - 7% No Bid No Bid No Bid

Childforms




& Blue
Valley
Industries
TofTurf by Roberson -—- No Bid No Bid Various N/A
Industries, Inc.
West Construction, Inc. | --- 5% 25% Various N/A
VENDOR ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM 9
(Ace Surfaces) --- - - — -
American Recreational | No No Bid No Bid $1.50 per sq ft | No Bid
Solutions, Inc.
Apollo Sunguard No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Systems
Bliss Products & Yes 7% 35% $1.75 persq ft | $55.00 per
Services, Inc. cubic yard
Christensen Systems | No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Columbia Cascade No 12% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Company
D.W. Recreation No No Bid 25% $1.50 persq ft | $30.00 per
Services, Inc. cubic yard
Gametime Yes 15% - 25% $1.25 persq ft | $28.00 per
$15,00 & up cubic yard
10% -
$14,999 &
less
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba | No 10% 10% $1.73 per sq ft | No Bid
Korkat, Inc.
Leadex Corporation Yes 2% 40% $1.38 persq ft | $45.00 per
Playcraft cubic yard
JanfEpape
BIUGIures)
Miracle Recreation Yes 10% 40% $1.50 persqft | $75.00 per
Equipment Company cubic yard
No Fault Sport Group, | No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LLC
Play It Safe Yes 10% 27% $1.60 persqft | $62.00 per
cubic yard
Playmore West, Inc. Yes 10% 35% $2.50 per sq ft | $65.00 per
$10,000 & cubic yard




2% less
than
10,000
PlayPower LT No 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Farmington, Inc.
RCP Shelters, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Regal Contractors, Yes No Bid 28% $2.00 per sq ft | $40.00 per
Inc. cubic yard
Rep Services, Inc. Yes 3% 36% $2.50 per sq ft | $50.00 per
cubic yard

Shade Systems, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SkyShades of South No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Florida
Southeast Surfacing & | No No Bid 35% $2.25 per sq ft | No Bid
Recreation LLC
Spectra Contract No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flooring
Sports Systems No 5% 75% $.95 per sq ft $28.00 per
International, Inc. cubic yard
Sun Shade, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Superior Park Yes 5% Superior | 75% $1.05 per sq ft | 30.00 per cubic
Systems, Inc. Park yard

Systems &

Recreation

Creations
Taylor Supply LLC No Bid 7% No Bid No Bid No Bid
TofTurf by Roberson No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Industries, Inc.
West Construction, No 5% 25% $1.75 persq ft | $33.00 per
Inc. cubic yard

ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13 ITEM 14

VENDOR

(Ace Surfaces)




American Recreational | $21.00 per $12.50 per | $6.50 per sq | No Bid $90.00 per
Solutions, Inc. linear ft linear ft ft cubic yard
Apollo Sunguard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Systems
Bliss Products & $20.00 per $19.50 per | $6.00 per sq | No Bid $23.00 per
Services, Inc. linear ft linear ft ft cubic yard
Christensen Systems | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Columbia Cascade No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Company
D.W. Recreation $15.00 per $9.00 per $4.00 per sq | $75.00 per $15.00 per
Services, Inc. linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
Gametime $1.00 per $12.00 per | $6.00 per sq | $85.00 per $75.00 per
linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba | $4.60 per $15.60 per | $4.36 per sq | No Bid $16.10 per
Korkat, Inc. linear ft linear ft ft cubic yard
Leadex Corporation $16.80 per $15.00 per | $4.50 per sq | $65.00 per $30.00 per
linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
Miracle Recreation $13.00 per $13.00 per | $7.00 per sq | No Bid $40.00 per
Equipment Company | linear ft linear ft ft cubic yard
No Fault Sport Group, | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LLC
Play It Safe $24/6” wide & | $16.00 per | $6.00 per sq | No Bid $39.00 per
$10/4” wide linear ft ft cubic yard
per linear ft
Playmore West, Inc. $20.00 per $12.00 per | $6.00 per sq | $100 per linear | $65.00 per
linear ft linear ft ft ft cubic yard
PlayPower LT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Farmington, Inc.
RCP Shelters, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Regal Contractors, $9.00 per $15.00 per | $5.00 per sq | $80.00 per $16.00 per
Inc. linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
Rep Services, Inc. $11.25 per $18.75 per | $6.25 per sq | $100.00 per $20.00 per
linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
Shade Systems, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SkyShades of South No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Florida
Southeast Surfacing & | $22/6” wide $40.00 per | $5.50 per sq | $40.00 per 45.00 per
Recreation LL.C & $15/4” wide | linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard




per linear ft
Spectra Contract No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flooring
Sports Systems $25/6” wide $23.00 per | $4.05 per sq | $33.00 per $20.00 per
international, Inc. & $13/4” wide | linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
per linear ft
Sun Shade, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Superior Park $29/6” wide $27.00 per | $5.50 per sq | $32.00per $22.00 per
Systems, Inc. & $13.75/4” linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
wide per
linear ft
Taylor Supply LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TofTurf by Roberson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Industries, Inc.
West Construction, $20.00 per $13.00 per | $4.50 per sq | $78.00 per $17.00 per
Inc. linear ft linear ft ft linear ft cubic yard
ITEM 15 ITEM 16 | ITEM 17 | ITEM 18 | ITEM 19 | Item 20 Item 21
VENDOR
(Ace Surfaces) | --- -— - - - - -—
American No Charge | $900.00 No Yes Yes No Bid No Bid
Recreational
Solutions, Inc.
Apollo No Bid $1,800.00 | No Yes No No No
Sunguard
Systems
Bliss Products | $250.00 $1,000.00 | No Yes Yes Yes Yes
& Services,
Inc.
Christensen No Bid No Bid No No Yes No No
Systems
Columbia No Bid No Bid No No No Yes No
Cascade
Company
D.W. $150.00 No Bid No No Yes No Yes
Recreation
Services, Inc.
Gametime $600.00 $675.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Lanier Plans, $300.00 $750.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Inc. dba
Korkat, Inc.




Leadex $450.00 $900.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Corporation

Miracle No Bid $950.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Recreation

Equipment

Company

No Fault Sport | No Bid No Bid Yes No No Yes Yes
Group, LLC

Play It Safe No Bid $650.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Playmore $1,000.00 | $750.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
West, Inc.

PlayPower LT | No Bid $550.00 | No Yes No No No
Farmington,

Inc.

RCP Shelters, | No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inc.

Regal $450.00 $1.000.00 | Yes No Yes Yes Yes
Contractors,

Inc.

Rep Services, | $500.00 $800.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid
Inc.

Shade No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes No Bid No Bid
Systems, Inc.

SkyShades of | No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid
South Florida

Southeast $200.00 $750.00 | Yes No Yes No Yes
Surfacing &

Recreation

LLC

Spectra No Bid No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Contract

Flooring

Sports $350.00 $2,500.00 | No Yes No Yes No
Systems

International,

Inc.

Sun Shade, No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes No Bid No Bid

Inc.




Superior Park | $375.00 $2,895.00 | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Systems, Inc.

Taylor Supply | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes No Bid
LLC

TofTurf by No Bid No Bid Yes No No Bid No Yes
Roberson

Industries, Inc.

West $300.00 $800.00 | No Yes No Yes No
Construction,
Inc.
LEGEND:
= Award
( ) = Reject

MINORITY - (2-African American, 3-Hispanic American, 4-Native American, 5-Asian American, 6-American Woman, 7-Physically
Impaired, 8-Other)

EXCEPTIONS:
Ace Surfaces - Reject entire bid. Bidder failed to submit required documents within the time
requirements.

Spectra CtractFIrlnq Reject Items 1 & 2 — Bidder does not sell or install playground equipment.

RECOMMENDATION: It is recommended that the award be made to all responsive and
responsible bidders in order to meet the needs of the School District.

Note: Original Bid document is available upon request.

BID PROTEST

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in §120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under
Chapter 120, Florida Statutes and applicable Board rules, regulations and policies. Offers from the vendors listed herein are the
only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if
any, are hereby rejected as late.

If a bidder wishes to protest a bid, they must do so in strict accordance with the procedures outlined in FS 120.57(3). Any person
who files an action protesting a decision or intended decision pertaining to this bid pursuant to FS 120.57(3)(b), shall post with
the Purchasing Department, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond secured by an acceptable surety company in
Florida payable to the School District of Palm Beach County in an amount equal to 1 percent (1%) of the total estimated contract
value, but not less than $500 nor more than $5,000. Bond shall be conditioned upon the payment of all costs that may be
adjudged against the protester in the administrative hearing in which the action is brought and in any subsequent appellate court
proceeding. In lieu of a bond, a cashier's check, certified bank check, bank certified company check or money order will be
acceptable form of security. If, after completion of the administrative hearing process and any appellate court proceedings, the
District prevails, it shall recover all costs and charges included in the final order of judgment, including charges by the Division of
Administrative Hearings. Upon payment of such costs and charges by the protester, the protest security shall be returned. If the
protest prevails, he or she shall recover from the District all costs and charges, which shall be included in the final order of
judgment.

DISQUALIFYING CRIMES

The bidder certifies by submission of this bid, that neither it nor its principals is presently debarred, suspended, proposed for
debarment, declared ineligible or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction by the State of Florida or Federal
Government. Further, bidder certifies that it has divulged, in its bid response, information regarding any of these actions or
proposed actions with other governmental agencies.

SS:GMKA




